LAUDERDALE COUNTY

§

The Lauderdale County Commission convened at the Lauderdale County Courthouse in the City of Florence, Alabama, at 5:00 p.m. on the 27th day of September, 2021. The meeting was called to order by the Chairman of the Lauderdale County Commission, Danny Pettus. Upon roll call the following members answered present:

Danny Pettus

Chairman

Roger Garner

Commissioner, District 1

Brad Holmes

Commissioner, District 1

Fay Parker

Commissioner, District 2

Joe Hackworth

Commissioner, District 2

Legal Counsel:

Christopher A. Smith

County Attorney

Chairman Danny Pettus, upon declaration of a quorum being present, opened the meeting for the transaction of business.

The invocation and Pledge of Allegiance were delivered by Chairman Pettus.

Awards and Presentations: None

Public Comments on Agenda Items: None

Commissioner Parker moved, seconded by Commissioner Garner that all items listed on the regular business agenda be approved for immediate consideration. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Agenda is herein recorded and made a part of these minutes.

Commissioner Holmes moved, seconded by Commissioner Garner that the minutes of the last regular meeting of the Commission be approved for recording. There being no discussion and upon vote taken, motion unanimously approved.

Commissioner Hackworth moved, seconded by Commissioner Parker to approve a resolution to authorize the Commission to enter into a partnership with Alabama State University regarding digital mapping software for the Board of Registrar's. This software will assist with redistricting and demographic updates made to voting districts within Lauderdale County. The cost for this service should not exceed two thousand five hundred dollars and any budget amendment needed is approved. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Resolution is herein recorded and made part of these minutes.

Commissioner Garner moved, seconded by Commissioner Holmes to approve a resolution to authorize the renewal of the Commission's website contract for fiscal year 2022. The Website Service Contract is with Digital Boutique Co., formerly Biz Marketing Agency. The annual retention fee is one thousand dollars and any budget amendment for this renewal is approved. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Resolution is herein recorded and made part of these minutes.

Commissioner Parker moved, seconded by Commissioner Hackworth to approve a resolution to authorize the renewal of Printers and Stationers, Inc. (PSI) for office supplies for fiscal year 2022. The Commission has received written notice from PSI that they will continue to honor the current catalog pricing discount of 34.1% for General Office Supplies for fiscal year 2022. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Resolution is herein recorded and made part of these minutes.

Commissioner Holmes moved, seconded by Commissioner Parker to approve a resolution to authorize a Budget Revision Request from Reappraisal. The Reappraisal Department has submitted a request for fiscal year 2021. Shortages in Office Supplies, Unemployment Insurance, Other Compensation and Management Consulting Services will be reconciled by excess funds in Contracted Services. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion approved. Resolution is herein recorded and made part of these minutes.

Commissioner Holmes moved, seconded by Commissioner Garner to reappoint Beverly Absher-Bone to the NACOLG Non-Elected Board of Directors with term effective immediately and expiring September 30th, 2022. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved.

Commissioner Hackworth moved, seconded by Commissioner Parker to reappoint John Allgood to the NACOLG Non-Elected Board of Directors with term effective immediately and expiring September 30th, 2022. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved.

Commissioner Parker moved, seconded by Commissioner Hackworth to reappoint Chip Kasmeier to the NACOLG Non-Elected Board of Directors with term effective immediately and expiring September 30th, 2022. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved.

Commissioner Parker moved, seconded by Commissioner Garner to approve an FMLA request by Judge Motlow for one of his Probate employees. Leave will begin September 24th, 2021, with anticipated return date of November 19th, 2021. All paperwork is in order for this leave. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid LA 2022-2 "Handicap Voter Access for O.C. Eppes Community Center". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 21st, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Administrator, Brenda Bryant, for her recommendation. Ms. Bryant stated that we only received one bid from a contractor and the price was high at forty-five thousand four hundred dollars. Commissioner Holmes motioned, seconded by Commissioner Parker to award the bid. A discussion was held regarding the lack of bidders and the unexpected expense of the bid received. Commissioner Holmes withdrew his motion. Commissioner Hackworth motioned, seconded by Commissioner Parker to table the bid until some research can be done to decide whether this is our only option before we award this bid or re-bid the project. There being no further discussion and upon a vote taken, motion tabled. Bid will not be awarded at this time.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid LA 2021-10 "Improvements at Brush Creek Park". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Administrator, Brenda Bryant, for her recommendation. She referred to Tom Smith and Eric Hill who were present at the mandatory pre-bid meeting with all prospective bidders. Two bidders were at the pre-bid meeting and both bid on the project. Rogers Group bid at a total cost of five hundred forty-five thousand dollars and Pierce & Allred bid a total cost of one hundred eighty-four thousand eight hundred forty-nine dollars. Tom Smith stated that there was some adjustment to the total area being paved as a certain portion of one road stays underwater and that portion will not be paved. Both bidders bid accordingly. Commissioner Hackworth asked about Pierce & Allred since we had a negative experience with them in the past even though they were the lowest bidder for this project. Eric

Hill stated that Pierce & Allred had recently acquired a reputable company in which he had much confidence in their performance. Mr. Hill further stated that he felt the large price difference between bidders showed the higher bidder wasn't very interested in the job. Chairman Pettus asked Mr. Hill if daily oversight of the construction would occur and Mr. Hill assured him it would. Commissioner Parker motioned, seconded by Commissioner Hackworth to award the bid to Pierce & Allred. There being no further discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Bid is awarded to Pierce & Allred of Florence, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid 2022-1 "Lubricants". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, for his recommendation. Mr. Hill recommended we award the bid to the only bidder, W.H. Thomas Oil. Commissioner Holmes motioned, seconded by Commissioner Garner to award the bid as recommended. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Bid is awarded to W.H. Thomas Oil of Decatur, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid 2022-2 "Polypropylene Pipe". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, for his recommendation. Mr. Hill recommended we award the bid to the only bidder, ADCO Pipe & Supply. Commissioner Hackworth motioned, seconded by Commissioner Garner to award the bid as recommended. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Bid is awarded to ADCO Pipe & Supply, LLC, of Florence, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid 2022-3 "Corrugated HDPE Pipe". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, for his recommendation. Mr. Hill recommended we award the bid to the only bidder, ADCO Pipe & Supply. Commissioner Parker motioned, seconded by Commissioner Hackworth to award the bid as recommended. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Bid is awarded to ADCO Pipe & Supply of Florence, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid 2022-4 "Traffic Signs & Reflectors". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, for his recommendation. Mr. Hill stated that we received bids from two companies – Vulcan Signs and Traffic Signs, Inc. – and he recommended the lowest bidder, Vulcan Signs. Commissioner Parker motioned, seconded by Commissioner Holmes to award the bid as recommended. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Bid is awarded to Vulcan Signs & Stamping, Inc. of Foley, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid 2022-5 "Resurfacing Various Lauderdale County Roads". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, for his recommendation. Mr. Hill stated that we received bids from two companies – Midsouth Paving and Rogers Group – and he recommended the lowest bidder, Midsouth Paving. Commissioner Garner motioned, seconded by Commissioner Holmes to award the bid as recommended. Commissioner Parker asked about the availability of Midsouth to complete the job requested since they had not completed work previously requested by the county. Mr. Hill stated that this is a known problem in our current job climate with a lack of workers to perform all that is needed no matter which company is awarded the bid. Upon a vote taken to award the bid, the Commissioners voted as follows:

Commissioner Garner – aye Commissioner Hackworth – aye

Commissioner Holmes – aye Commissioner Parker – nay

There being no further discussion, motion approved. Bid is awarded to Midsouth Paving, Inc. of Tuscumbia, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid 2022-6 "Striping Various Lauderdale County Roads". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, for his recommendation. Mr. Hill stated that we received bids from two companies — Ozark Striping and Riverside Traffic System — and he recommended the lowest bidder, Ozark Striping. Commissioner Hackworth motioned, seconded by Commissioner Garner to award the bid as recommended. A discussion was held regarding the fact that Ozark has been unable to complete previous jobs for the county and Mr. Hill stated that Ozark worked for most Alabama counties, but the demand is so great and the vendors so few that they are the only option at this time. Commissioner Parker asked Mr. Hill about the county doing their own striping with their own equipment and employees. A discussion was held regarding the many factors to consider if the county were to do their own striping. Mr. Hill stated that he would look further into what all that would entail and report back to the Commission. Upon a vote taken to award the bid, the Commissioners voted as follows:

Commissioner Garner – aye Commissioner Hackworth – aye

Commissioner Holmes – aye Commissioner Parker – nay

There being no further discussion, motion approved. Bid is awarded Ozark Striping Co., Inc. of Ozark, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

In compliance with bid laws of the State of Alabama, sealed bids were advertised for Bid 2022-7 "Hot Mix Asphalt (Pick-up at Plant)". Bids were received and publicly read aloud on September 23rd, 2021. Chairman Pettus asked County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, for his recommendation. Mr. Hill stated that we received bids from two companies – Midsouth Paving and Rogers Group – and he recommends we go with the lowest bidder, Midsouth Paving. Mr. Hill further stated that Rogers Group would supply the product at their bid price should Midsouth be unable to provide for any reason. Commissioner Holmes motioned, seconded by Commissioner Garner to award the bid as recommended. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved. Bid is awarded to Midsouth Paving, Inc. of Tuscumbia, Alabama. Bid tabulation sheet is recorded and made part of these minutes.

All invoiced bills were audited, allowed and ordered to be paid upon by a motion made by Commissioner Parker seconded by Commissioner Holmes. There being no discussion and upon a vote taken, motion unanimously approved.

CHECKS ISSUED SEPTEMBER 13TH, 2021 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 26TH, 2021

GENERAL-SPECIAL CHECK #58041-58080	\$560,331.26
AGRI-BUSINESS FUND CHECK #3927-3931	\$1,004.49
LEPA FUND CHECK #8649-8655	\$4,060.91
GASOLINE TAX FUND CHECK #17945-17957	\$163,011.16
PUBLIC BLDG., R & B SPECIAL CHECK #N/A	\$0.00

PUBLIC HIGHWAY & TRAFFIC FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
AL. TRUST CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
RRR GASOLINE TAX FUND CHECK #718		\$12,653.60
REAPPRAISAL FUND CHECK #12132-12139		\$50,151.95
REAPPRAISAL MONEY MARKET CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
TOURISM, REC. & CONVENTION FUND CHECK #572-573		\$9,020.38
RSVP FUND CHECK #17801-17807		\$1,682.90
CHILD PROTECTION FUND CHECK #1256		\$1,168.34
REBUILD ALABAMA GAS TAX FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
REBUILD ALABAMA DIESEL TAX FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
FEDERAL AID EXCHANGE FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
WORKPLACE DEVELOPMENT CENTER FUN CHECK #N/A	D	\$0.00
SPECIAL GRANTS FUND CHECK #1005-1006		\$132,570.83
CORONAVIRUS RESCUE ACT FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
CDBG FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
SOLID WASTE FUND CHECK #8526-8535		\$184,136.85
ACCOUNT PAYABLE FUND CHECK #44724-44799		\$1,677,806.34
FIRE PROTECTION FEE FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT TAX FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
TOBACCO TAX FUND CHECK #N/A		\$0.00
TVA TAX FUND		\$353,199.43
CHECK #6142-6154	TOTAL:	\$3,150,798.44

Scheduled Public Hearings: None

Staff Reports:

Lauderdale County Road Department Engineer, Eric Hill, reported on his investigation into the County Road near Rock Church and the remedy to the standing water issue occurring on the roadway. Mr. Hill stated that a long-term solution would involve a grid material to fill and raise the existing road and finish with paving. A discussion was held about the details of this solution and a recommendation of having a designer to inspect the road once complete. Mr. Hill stated that he could have all details back to the Commission by the end of October and could possibly start the project as early as Spring 2022.

Public Comment Period:

Several members of the Rock Church community were present. Latoyia Jones, Nathaniel Simpson and Henry Simpson had clarifying questions and further recommendations regarding Mr. Hill's solution for the road. Commissioner Holmes stated that the county can repair the roadway and the church would need to be prepared for any work that may be necessary on their property at their own expense in order to accommodate the raised roadway adjoining their parking lot.

Commissioner Parker stated that he wanted to clarify his opposition to awarding the bids for the striping and paving of county roads.

There being no further business to come before the Commission and upon a motion made by Commissioner Garner and seconded by Commissioner Holmes, the meeting was duly adjourned until the next regular meeting subject to call.

LAUDERDALE COUNTY COMMISSION

Danny Pettus, Chairman

-absent-

Roger Garner, Commissioner

Brad Holmes, Commissioner

Fay Parker, Commissioner

Joe Hackworth, Commissioner

ATTEST:

Brenda Bryant, County Administrator

LAUDERDALE COUNTY COMMISSION

REGULAR MEETING AGENDA

September 27th, 2021

A. OFFICIAL AGENDA

- 1. CALL TO ORDER AND WELCOME
- 2. CALL OF ROLL TO ESTABLISH QUORUM
- 3. INVOCATION AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE- Chairman Pettus
- 4. AWARDS AND PRESENTATIONS
- 5. PUBLIC COMMENTS ON AGENDA ITEMS

Per Rules of Procedure there is a three-minute time limit

B. REGULAR BUSINESS

- 1. Review and Motion to Consider Agenda Items
- 2. Approve minutes of last meeting
- 3. Resolution—Alabama State University Mapping BOR
- 4. Resolution—Website Renewal FY2022
- 5. Resolution—PSI Renewal FY2022
- 6. Resolution Budget Revision Reappraisal
- 7. Approval of Board Appointments
- 8. Approval of FMLA
- 9. BID NO LA 2022-2 "Handicap Voter Access for O.C. Eppes Community Center"
- 10. BID NO LA 2021-10 "Improvements at Brush Creek Park"
- 11. BID NO 2022-1 "Lubricants"
- 12. BID NO 2022-2 "Polypropylene Pipe"
- 13. BID NO 2022-3 "Corrugated HDPE Pipe"
- 14. BID NO 2022-4 "Traffic Signs & Reflectors"
- 15. BID NO 2022-5 "Resurfacing Various Lauderdale County Roads"
- 16. BID NO 2022-6 "Striping Various Lauderdale County Roads"
- 17. BID NO 2022-7 "Hot Mix Asphalt" (Pickup at Plant)
- 18. Audit and Approve Invoiced Bills
- C. SCHEDULED PUBLIC HEARINGS none
- D. STAFF REPORTS
- E. PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD (Per Rules of Procedure there is a three-minute time limit)
- F. ADJOURN

STATE OF ALABAMA

LAUDERDALE COUNTY §

WHEREAS, the Lauderdale County Commission will enter into a partnership with Alabama State University as they provide software for the Board of Registrar's office relating to digital mapping; and

WHEREAS, the cost for this service will not exceed two thousand five hundred dollars and will include software and support as redistricting and demographic updates are made to voting districts within Lauderdale County.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Lauderdale County Commission to partner with Alabama State University and any budget amendment needed for this project is herein approved.

Done this the 27th day of September, 2021.

Administrator

LAUDERDALE COUNTY COMMISSION

Danny Pettus, Chairman

Garner, Commissioner

Brad Holmes, Commissioner

Joe Hackworth, Commissioner

LAUDERDALE COUNTY §

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Lauderdale County Commission would like to renew its Website Service Contract with Digital Boutique Co., formerly Biz Marketing Agency, for their continued management of the Lauderdale County website; and

WHEREAS, the renewal, effective October 1st, 2021, through September 30th, 2022, has an annual retention fee of one thousand dollars plus sixty dollars per hour for periodically requested tasks with a one hour minimum per occurrence.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Lauderdale County Commission approves the Website Service Contract with Digital Boutique Co. of Florence, Alabama, and authorizes any budget amendment necessary for this contract.

Done this the 27th day of September, 2021.

LAUDERDALE COUNTY COMMISSION

Danny Pettus, Chairman

Roger Garner, Commissioner

Brad Holmes, Commissioner

Fay Parker Commissioner

Brenda Bryant, County Administrator

ATTEST:

Joe Hackworth, Commissioner

Digital Boutique Co. Website Service Contract

This contract is a legally binding agreement betweenLauderdale County
Commission and Digital Boutique Co., entered into on10/1/2021
Agreement
- Whereas Digital Boutique Co. will be available as the website manager for the client
Whereas the Client will compensate Digital Boutique Co. for said services by paying a fee
(See Sec. 3) due on10/1/2021
Terms 1. Duration
-Digital Boutique Co. will render services to the Client for an initial period of 1 year beginning on10/1/2021
-Digital Boutique Co. will work to establish what techniques will work best for the organization as well.
-Should the Client choose to terminate the contract, they are to give an initial thirty (7) day notice, the Client must present Digital Boutique Co. with a written notice of termination
2. Services
- Digital Boutique Co. will establish the organization's presence by doing the following
services selected by the clientAnnual management fee is\$1,000 Digital Bouti Co. will bill the client upon completion of periodically requested tasks for \$60 Hourly maintenance fee with a one hour minimum.
3. Compensation- Digital Boutique Co. accept payment through Freshbooks or by Check.
- In the event that the Client fails to pay the Digital Boutique Co. according to the paym

schedule in Freshbooks, Digital Boutique Co. will cease to provide services until payment is received. -Once payment for the period has been made in full, Digital Boutique Co. will

resume provision

of services. Should a suspension of services occur, the complete payment will be necessary to resume services – a prorated amount will not be provided

- 4. Account Access & Authorization -Digital Boutique Co. is authorized by the Client to assume the identity of the Client in all social media interactions on the internet including, but not limited to, status updates, blog posts, online forum discussions and message board posts, comments, and responses to user comments, and emails. Digital Boutique Co. will hold the Client's URLs, usernames, and passwords in confidence. Digital Boutique Co. will not share this information under any circumstances, nor will the Consultant sell this information to a third (3rd) party.
- 5. **Rights to Created Content** The Client will retain the right to all content created by Digital Boutique Co. for the Client, while under contract, ad infinitum. However, the Client may not distribute for profit any content created by Digital Boutique Co. for the Client, while under contract, without the written consent of Digital Boutique Co..
- Furthermore, Digital Boutique Co. will retain the right to use any and all content created by Digital Boutique Co. for the Client, while under contract, for the purpose of (1) providing samples of Digital Boutique Co. work or (2) instruction including, but not limited to, presentations, lectures, webinars, and published material in any medium.
- 6. Access to Client Information From time to time, Digital Boutique Co. may need to keep client information on file due to the nature of uploading content to the website. This information will be stored in an electronic folder and deleted upon completion of the task.
- Digital Boutique Co. will not share this information under any circumstances, nor will Digital Boutique Co. sell this information to a third (3rd) party.
- 7. Liability Waiver Establishing a social media presence and initiating a two-way flow of communication between the Client and the public can have unintended consequences on the Client's reputation. Should this occur, the Client waives its right to Digital Boutique Co. responsible for any damage and/or liability that may arise from Digital Boutique Co. actions on behalf of the Client. If, at any time, the Client does not agree with actions taken by Digital Boutique Co. in its behalf, it must notify Digital Boutique Co. in writing. If Digital Boutique Co. receives such a communication, Digital Boutique Co. will post a retraction and apology across all affected platforms within twenty-four (24) hours.
- 8. Service Interruption Either party shall be excused from any delay or failure in performance required hereunder if caused by reason of any occurrence or contingency beyond its reasonable control, including, but not limited to, acts of God, acts of war, fire, laws, proclamations, edits, ordinances or regulations, riots, earthquakes, floods, explosions or other acts of nature. The obligations and rights of the party so excused shall be extended on a day-to-day basis for the

time period equal to the period of such excusable interruption. When such events have abated, the parties' respective obligations hereunder shall resume. In the event the interruption of the excused party's obligations continues for a period in excess of thirty (30) days, either party shall have the right to terminate this Agreement upon ten days' prior written notice to the other party. Amendments & Addendum

- This contract is to be considered complete and final. However, the field of social media is rapidly changing and said changes may necessitate amendment or addition to this contract. Should such a need arise, the amendment or addendum must be drawn up as a separate document, signed by both parties indicating their agreement, and a copy of the signed document must be provided to the Client and, Digital Boutique Co..

Entire Agreement - Should either party violate the terms of or fail to meet the obligations set forth in this contract, such action will render the opposing party free from any further contractual obligation. IN WITNESS WHEREOF, both parties signify their authority to act on their organization's behalf and agreement to abide by the terms of this contract effective the date written above by the signatures affixed below.

Client

Chent.		
Dannulettus	{Name - Printed}	
Commission Chair	(Title & Organization)	
Danny Ethins	{ {Signature}	
9/20/21	{Date}	
Consultant:		
Sydney Brewer	[Name – Printed]	
Manager, Digital Boutiqu	ie Co{{7}	Title & Organization)
Sydney Brewer	{{Signature}}	
10/1/21	(Data)	

LAUDERDALE COUNTY §

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Commission has received written notice from Printers and Stationers that they will continue to honor the pricing discount of 34.1% for "General Office Supplies" for one year using the 2021-2022 Office Supplies Catalog for the term beginning October 1st, 2021, through September 30th, 2022.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Lauderdale County Commission that office supplies shall be purchased from the 2021-2022 Office Supplies Catalog for the fiscal year 2022 from Printers and Stationers of Florence.

Done this the 27th day of September, 2021.

LAUDERDALE COUNTY COMMISSION

Danny Pettus, Chairman

Roger Garner, Commissioner

Brad Holmes, Commissioner

Fay Parker, Commissioner

Joe Hackworth, Commissione

Brenda Bryant, County Administrator

LAUDERDALE COUNTY §

RESOLUTION

BE IT RESOLVED by the Lauderdale County Commission that the Reappraisal Department Budget for Fiscal Year 2020-2021 is herein amended by line items only. Shortages occurring in Office Supplies, Unemployment Insurance, Other Compensation and Management Consulting Services shall be reconciled by excess funds in Contracted Services, according to the attached Budget Revision Request.

Done this the 27th day of September, 2021.

LAUDERDALE COUNTY COMMISSION

Danny Pettus, Chairman

Roger Garner, Commissioner

Brad Holmes, Commissioner

ATTEST:

Brenda Bryant, County Administrator

Fay Parker, Commissioner

Joe Hackworth, Commissioner

BUDGET REVISION REQUEST

County	Lauderdale			
	(Please Print) Bro	enda Br	vant.	
Title/Position	Haministrator	-		
Contact Numb	per(s): <u>256-766</u>	5-5747		
Budget Year:	9090-9091			
<u> </u>	T +		D 4 . J	D • 1
Line Item	Line Item	Approved	Requested Amendment	Revised
Number	Description	Amount	Antenditent	Amount
100	Other Comp	7	00.00T	1,700.00
126	Mongolayment	850.00	70:20	990.00
173	Wality Gous, Sarn	11/338.00		18,098.00
311	Office Supplies	10,000.00	1,000.30	11,000.00
190	Contracted Setu.	12000.00	(4,440.00)	7,560.00
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	16 T		
			<u> </u>	
			-	
		I		1
amount' column amendments' col budget amount b	the total amount that the entire for the line items listed above). It is above, but and any other the sum of the amendment	The '+/- amendment columns. The 'revise ts.	ts' below is the sum ed budget' below is th	of the 'requeste ne sum of the toto
The purpose of	of this section below is to reflect h		/- Amendments Re	
Total Budge	t	שלב ביים	8 1	777 709
		001,101	1 .	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,
Reason(s):	Budget line	Hem c	in tenche	2045
Signature: _	(Please use an attachmen	problems and the control of the cont	Date: 4/20/U	
_	Date Appr	oved by County	/ Commission: _	9/28/21

Alabama County and Finance Manual (1997), Section 3, Exhibit 15

This form can be faxed or mailed

RID NO.:	LA 2021-10	Mail Ads Pre Mlg	8/22, 8/29,9/5
BID ITEM:	Improvements at Brush Creek Park	Qoen	9/9 1h 9/23 1h
OPENING: DATE MAILED:	September 23 rd , 2021 August 18 th , 2021	Mig	7/27

Bogin 10/4 60 days

					Sand 12/3
	BID BOND	NO BID	LOW	NO RESP	AMOUNT
Midsouth Paving Inc 23010 Highway 72 W Tuscumbia AL 35674					
Rogers Group Inc 520 Three Mile Lane Tuscumbia AL 35674	√				Base B2 - \$ 260, 000 Alternate 1 - \$ 70,000 Alternate 2-9215, 000
Wiregrass Construction Co Inc 3848 Highway 20 Trinity AL 35673					
Pierce-Allred Pickedup 9/7/21	/		√		Bose And -176,250 Alternate 1-442,071
					Alternete 2 - \$ 18 1 near 5 \$66, 528
·					
					·

					8	7	6 5	4	3	2	1
DID 110 (1			
BID NO. 2022-1			_								
BID ITEM: LUBRICAL			_								
BID OPENING: 9/23/202	1		_			1	İ				
					[ĺ			
	NO	LOW	NO								
	BID	BID	RESP	AMOUNT							
Tatum Oil Co.		1.		J				+-			
P. O. Box 248											
Sheffield, AL 35660			X							ł	
Carter Oil Co.								+	-	_	
604 East Second Street						ŀ					
P. O. Box 487	İ		\ <u>/</u>							ı	
Sheffield, AL 35660			X								
			ļ								
W. H. Thomas Oil Co., Inc.]		See			\top	\top	T^{\dagger}		_
709 Finley Island Road				See last							
Decatur, AL 35601	Ì	X		Maches						ļ	
Oakley Lawn & Garden, LLC		/ \		T		\perp		ļ			
4990 Highway 157										İ	
Florence, AL 35633			X								
1 10101100, 712 00000		1	/\	-							
Called and asked for it to be emailed		İ						 	H		
Clear Fuel, LLC							İ			ļ	
5909 Echo Drive			X		- 1			İ			
Knoxville, TN 37919		}			Ì						
Jeff Taylor 865-588-4465 Oclean Callicon	4						_				
Kimbro Oil Company			_								
2200 Clifton Avenue			ΙX		1						
Nashville, TN 37203			```								
			<u> </u>			+	+	-	\dashv	\dashv	
		,]							
		<u> </u>							1		
					Ì						
		ĺ								ļ	
	 			† <u> </u>	\dashv	+	┪	\vdash	\dashv	十	
	<u> </u>		<u> </u>				-		\perp	_	
	1				İ						

LAUDERDALE COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT BID INVITATION NO. 2022-1 Effective 10/1/2021 through 9/30/2022

BID FORM LUBRICANTS

	Cherry
1.	Fnoine Oil (SAE 10 through 50) for API Service CD Product Delo
	1/5.19 per gallon in 55 gal drums
	7.87 per gallon in 24 one-quart cans per case 16.23 per gallon in one gallon cans per case
	16,23 per gallon in one gallon cans per case
	Chevron
2.	Engine Oil Multi-Viscosity 15W-40 for API Service CC Product //RSA
	11.64 per gallon in 55 gal. drum
	No Bip per gallon in 24 one-quart cans per case
	15,23 per gallon in one gallon cans per case
_	
3.	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Dexron II Product Full Sunthefir MV ATK
	per gallon in 55 gal. drums
	20,82 per gallon in 24 one-quart cans per case
4.	Special Tractor Hydraulic Fluid Product 1000 THF
т.	2.84 per gallon in 55 gal. drums
	NO BTO per gallon in 24 one-quart cans per case
	Cherry Open Great
5.	Open Gear Lubricant, Asphaltic Type Product Lube 100 NC
	340 per pound in 35-pound containers
	Top Spec Aw
6.	Anti-Wear Hydraulic Oil, A. W. Hyd. 32,46 or 68 Product 32,46,68
	per gallon in 55 gal. drums
	9.84 per gallon in 5 gal. cans Chevran Deles
7.	Constitutions SAF BOW OR I SAF BOW IAR D. I Const FP-5
/٠	Gear Lubricant - SAE 80W-90 and SAE 85W-140 Product Great EP-5 1.98 per pound in 35 pound containers
	1, 75 per pound in 120 pound containers
	Chevran Multifak
3.	Multi-purpose Lithium Base Grease Product Ef 2
	2.7% per pound in 35 pound containers
	2.75per pound in 120 pound containers
	3.77 per tube of 14 ounces
_	Wheel Bearing and General Purpose Grease Product DeloGrease EP 2
€.	Wheel Bearing and General Purpose Grease Product Delo Grease El
	3,15 per pound in 35 pound containers

Chevron Delo TOTATORCE SAE 30 10. Transmission To Four 30 W 15.20 per gallon in 5 gallon cans Spirax Gear oil full synthetic SAE 75W-90 Chevron Delo Syn-Gear 28.01 per gallon in 5 gallon cans XDM SAE 75W-90 11. 28.01 per gallon in 5 gallon cans Premium Lithium EP Semi Fluid Grease NLGI 00-000 Chevron Multifak 00 12. 2,47 per gallon in 5 gallon cans Chevron Delo 400LE SAE 15W-40 Formulated for API CK-4

16,29 per gallon in 1 gallon containers

Chevron Delo 400L SAE 15W-40

Chevron Delo 400 SDE 13. CAM2 Synavex Trans-F/nid50 14 Trans Fluid SAE Super Synthetic 50 W 26.71 per gallon in 5 gallon containers Dexos I approved SAE 0W-20 Synthetic Motor Oil CAN2 Synavex Full Synthetic 23,97 per gallon in 24 one-quart cans per case

Vo Bropper gallon in one gallon cans per case

Lexos I Gen 2 OW-20 15. No Broper gallon in one gallon cans per case Certified DEF 16. Diesel Exhaust Fluid, API certified 3.00 per gallon in 2-2.5 gallon jugs per case Automatic Transmission Fluid, Dexron VI Product Synthetic Multi-Vehicle 21.22 per gallon in 55 gallon drum

23.97 per gallon in 24 one-quart cans per case

Dexos 1 and 12 17. Dexos 1 approved SAE 5W-30 Full Synthetic Motor Oil CAM2 Synavex Full 23.99 per gallon in 24 one-quart cans per case Synthetic dexos 1 Some gallon in one gallon cans per case Gen 2 5W-30 No bipper gallon in one gallon cans per case

BID NO: 2022-2
BID ITEM: Polypropylene Pipe BID OPENING: 9/23/2021 NO LOW NO RESP BID BID **AMOUNT** Harvey Culvert Co. P. O. Box 259 Cleveland, AL 35409 G & O Supply Co., Inc. P. O. Box 90 X Houston, MS 38851 Eagle Wholesale Company P. O. Box 815 X Athens, AL 35612 Construction Materials 3288 Wall Triana Hwy X Huntsville, AL 35824 Lance Whitworth ADCO Pipe & Supply, LLC See Attached 4014 Florence Blvd. Florence, AL 35634 Bill Colloredo 256-757-7473

ADCO Pipe & Supply

BID FORM POLYPROYLENE PIPE

BID INVITATION NO. 2022-2 Effective 10/1/2021 through 9/30/2022

Diameter (inches)	Price per linear foot
15	\$17.64
18	\$23.31
24	\$39.30
30	\$61.18
36	\$66.99
42	\$90.33
48	\$118.41
54	"NA"
60	\$185.61

						8	7	6	5	4	3	2	1
BID NO:	2022-3												
	Corrugated		ensity P	_ olyethy	lene								
DID ODENING	(HDPE) Pi	pe 1		_									
BID OPENING:	9/23/202	<u> </u>					:						
		NO	LOW	NO							Ì		
		BID	BID	RESP	AMOUNT								
Harvey Culvert Co. P. O. Box 259													
Cleveland, AL 35409				X								;	
				' \									
G & O Supply Co., Inc.													
P. O. Box 90 Houston, MS 38851				X									
Eagle Wholesale Company				<u> </u>									
P. O. Box 815				ا ر									
Athens, AL 35612				X									
Construction Materials 3288 Wall Triana Hwy				_V .									
Huntsville, AL 35824				X									
Lance Whitworth ADCO Pipe & Supply, LLC			-	 									
4014 Florence Blvd.					See 3								
Florence, AL 35634 Bill Colloredo					See Hachel								
256-757-7473				<u> </u>	P.								
			<u> </u>										
												ļ	
							}						
						, !		ļ					
	-		+	 					\vdash				
			 	 	 			-					_
	ŀ												
				_									

ADCO Pipe & Supply

BID FORM
CORRUGATED HIGH DENSITY
POLYETHYLENE (HDPE) PIPE
BID INVITATION NO. 2022-3
Effective 10/1/2021 through 9/30/2022

NA	\$161.34	60
NA	"NA"	54
NA	\$89.50	48
NA	\$72.40	42
NA	\$52.80	36
NA	\$42.69	30
NA	\$30.08	24
NA	\$16.71	18
NA	\$12.92	15
*Price per coupling (each)	Price per linear foot	Diameter (inches)

*If the size is available in bell and spigot, mark "NA" in the coupling column.

						8	7	, 6	5	4	3	2	1 .
BID NO. 2													
BID ITEM													
BID OPENING													
							İ						
		NO BID	LOW BID	NO RESP	AMOUNT								
Vulcan Signs & Stamping, Inc.		7		TKEOF			 -	\vdash				_	
P. O. Box 850 Faley, AL 36536					See								
			X		Mac							ĺ	
Traffic Signs 850 Whites Gap Rd. SE					S00 \								
Jacksonville, AL 36265		Ì	ł		See Attached Attached						}		
G & C Supply Co.			 							_	\dashv	_	\dashv
P. O.Drawer 459 Atwood, TN 38220		X		1									
										Ì			
						, "							
					1							ļ	1
		<u> </u> `								ĺ			
* .			 	 	-	_					_	\dashv	
]						İ	İ	
	·	<u> </u>	<u> </u>										
					ļ .								1
						1	ĺ			ļ			
						\dashv	_				_		_
													ŀ
						_				\dashv	\dashv	1	_
					·	1			:				Ì
	·												
										ĺ			
		-	<u> </u>			\dashv	\dashv		\dashv	\dashv	+		\dashv
								ļ					

BID INVITATION NO. 2022-4

Effective 10/1/2021 through 9/30/2022

DELINEATORS

PRICE Retroreflector Delineator, Type 1 - Any Color Round Individual 3 1/4" Button /each **OBJECT MARKER** Type 3 Object Markers (Any Style) 12" X 36" 15.20 /each **SIGNS** Type III or IV Two Color Standard Signs 5.06 _/sq. ft. Multi Color Standard Signs _/sq .ft. 5.14 R1-1 Stop Sign (30" X 30") 29.64 /each R1-1 Stop Sign (36" X 36") 42.70 /each

24.31

/each

M1-6 County Route Marker (24" X 24")

Vulcon Signs

BID INVITATION NO. 2022-4

Effective <u>10/1/2021</u> through <u>9/30/2022</u>

DELINEATORS

PRICE

Retroreflector Delineator, Type 1 - Any Color Round Individual 3 1/4" Button . 91 /each

OBJECT MARKER

Type 3 Object Markers (Any Style) 12" X 36"

20.46 /each

SIGNS

Type III or IV

Two Color Standard Signs <u>la.82</u>/sq. ft.

Multi Color Standard Signs <u>L. 98</u>/sq .ft.

R1-1 Stop Sign (30" X 30") 40.50 /each

R1-1 Stop Sign (36" X 36") 58.32 /each

M1-6 County Route Marker (24" X 24") 31.00 /each

* Pluase See attached Bid Stipulations

Traffic Signs, Inc. 850 Whites Gap Rd. S.E Jacksonville, AL 36265

BID NO: 2022-5 BID ITEM: Resurfacing Various Lauderdale Co. Rds. Thursday, September 23, 2021 @ 11:00 am								Item 6	Item 5	Item 4	Item 3	Item 2	Item 1
	BI BO		NO BID	LOW BID	NO RESP	BID AMOUNT	701C-001	701C-000	424B	424A	424B	424A	408A-052
Midsouth Paving Inc. 23010 Hwy 72 W Tuscumbia, AL 35674	>			X		-	972.00	972.00	62.70	65.98	68.70	71.98	2.27
Rogers Group Inc. 520 Three Mile Lane Tuscumbia, AL 35674	X			·			1,100.00	1,1 00.00	78.00	70.00	85.00	76.90	1.92
Wiregrass Construction Co 3848 Highway 20 Trininty, AL 35673	., Inc.				X		0	0					
												•	
											;		
												4114	

BID INVITATION NO. <u>2022-5</u> Effective <u>October 1, 2021</u> thru <u>September 17, 2022</u>

RESURFACING VARIOUS COUNTY ROADS

ITEM		PRICE
ltem 1	. 408A-052 Planing Existing Pavement (Approximately 1.10" thru 2.0" Thick) <u>Disposal of planing material will be provided</u> by Lauderdale County owned and operated dump trucks.	\$ 2, 27 /per SQ YD#
Item 2.	424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, ½" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived – local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum)	\$ <u>71.98</u> /per ton*
Item 3.	424B, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived – local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum)	\$ <u>68.70</u> /per ton *
	424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, ½" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived – local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum) All pickup and delivery of hot mix asphalt will be provided by Lauderdale County owned and operated dump trucks.	\$ <u>65.98</u> /perton@
	424B, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived – local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum) All pickup and delivery of hot mix asphalt will be provided by Lauderdale County owned and operated dump trucks.	\$ <u>62,70</u> /perton@
ltem 6.	701C-000 Broken Temporary Traffic Stripe	\$ <u>972,00</u> /mile
Item 7.	701C-001 Solid Temporary Traffic Stripe	\$ <u>972.00</u> /mile

- # Lauderdale County will haul off and retain planing materials by use of County equipment and employees.
- * These items include the contractor hauling the asphalt to the sites and installing the asphalt.
- @ These items include Lauderdale County trucks and employees picking up and hauling the asphalt to the sites and the contractor installing the asphalt.

MidSouth

BID INVITATION NO. <u>2022-5</u> Effective <u>October 1, 2021</u> thru <u>September 17, 2022</u>

RESURFACING VARIOUS COUNTY ROADS

HEM		PRICE
ltem 1	 408A-052 Planing Existing Pavement (Approximately 1.10" thru 2.0" Thick) <u>Disposal of planing material will be provided</u> <u>by Lauderdale County owned and operated dump trucks.</u> 	\$ 1.92 /per SQ YD
Item 2	2. 424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, ½" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived — local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum)	\$
ltem 3	. 424B, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived – local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum)	\$ 85.00 /per ton *
item 4.	424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, ½" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived – local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum) All pickup and delivery of hot mix asphalt will be provided by Lauderdale County owned and operated dump trucks.	\$ 70.00 /per ton @
	424B, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement Waived – local approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP Maximum) All pickup and delivery of hot mix asphalt will be provided by Lauderdale County owned and operated dump trucks.	\$ 78.00 /perton @
ltem 6.	701C-000 Broken Temporary Traffic Stripe	\$ 1,100.00/mile
Item 7.	701C-001 Solid Temporary Traffic Stripe	\$ 1,100.00 /mile

- # Lauderdale County will haul off and retain planing materials by use of County equipment and employees.
- * These items include the contractor hauling the asphalt to the sites and installing the asphalt.
- @ These items include Lauderdale County trucks and employees picking up and hauling the asphalt to the sites and the contractor installing the asphalt.

Rogers Group. Inc.

9-23-202

BID NO: 2022-6

BID ITEM: Striping Various Lauderdale County Roads BID OPENING: Thursday, September 23, 2021 – 11:00 a.m.

BID NO LOW NO BID **BOND** BID BID **RESP AMOUNT** Ozark Striping Co., Inc. See Attached 1273 W. Roy Parker Road Ozark, AL 36360 6.0. BOX GAM 36361 Riverside Traffic Systems 1283 State Hwy 178 West See Attachel New Albany, MS 38652 J. C. Cheek Contractors, Inc. P. O. Box 188 Lacey Springs, AL 35754 Attn: Lanier Conlee Pope Striping 7445 John Bragg Hwy, Suite 101 Murfreesboro, TN 37127 C & D Safety Company 860 Visco Dr. Nashville, TN 37210 Kerr Brothers & Associates Inc. 935 3rd Avenue South Nashville, TN 37210 X

BID INVITATION NO. 2022-6 Effective <u>October 1, 2021</u> thru <u>September 17, 2022</u>

STRIPING VARIOUS LAUDERDALE COUNTY ROADS

1.	701A-004	Solid White, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
		\$ 925.00 /mile o-5 miles
		\$ 775.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ 775.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ 775.00 /mile 21 miles and over
2.	701A-008	Broken Yellow, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
		\$ 450.00 /mile o-5 miles
		\$ 395.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ 395.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ 395.00 /mile 21 miles and over
3.	701A-012	Solid Yellow, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
		\$ 925.00 /mile o-5 miles
	•	\$ 775.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ 775.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ 775.00 /mile 21 miles and over
4.	701A-030	Solid White, Class 2T, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
		\$ 2,400.00 /mile 0-5 miles
		\$ 2,125.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ <u>2,125.00</u> /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ 2,125.00 /mile 21 miles and over

5 -	701A-034	Solid Yellow, Class 2T, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
·		\$ <u>2,400.00</u> /mile 0-5 miles
		\$ 2,125.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ 2,125.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ 2,125.00 /mile 21 miles and over
6.	701A-044	Broken Yellow, Class 2T, Type A Traffic Stripe– in place
		\$ 1,250.00 /mile o-5 miles
		\$ 1,065.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ 1,065.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$_1,065.00 /mile 21 miles and over
7.	701A - 231	Solid White, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
		\$ 3,200.00 /mile o-5 miles
		\$ 2,900.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ 2,900.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ 2,900.00 /mile 21 miles and over
8.	701A-235	Solid Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
	,	\$_3,200.00 /mile 0-5 miles
		\$ 2,900.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$_2,900.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ <u>2,900.00</u> /mile 21 miles and over
9.	701A-245	Broken Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place
		\$ 1,875.00 /mile o-5 miles
		\$ 1,750.00 /mile 6-10 miles
		\$ 1,750.00 /mile 11-20 miles
		\$ 1,750.00 /mile 21 miles and over

BID INVITATION NO. 2022-6 Effective October 1, 2021 thru September 17, 2022

STRIPING VARIOUS LAUDERDALE COUNTY ROADS

1. 701A-004 Solid White, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place

\$ 790,00/mile 6-10 miles

\$ 780,00/mile 11-20 miles

\$ 7 80,00 /mile 21 miles and over

2. 701A-008 Broken Yellow, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place

\$ 475.00/mile 0-5 miles

\$ 465.00/mile 6-10 miles

\$ 455.00/mile 11-20 miles

\$ 455.00/mile 21 miles and over

3. 701A-012 Solid Yellow, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place

\$ \(\frac{\gamma DD.}{\circ} \) mile 0-5 miles

\$ 790.00/mile 6-10 miles

\$ 780.00 /mile 11-20 miles

\$<u>780.00</u>/mile 21 miles and over

4. 701A-030 Solid White, Class 2T, Type A Traffic Stripe – in place

\$_2500.00/mile o-5 miles

\$ 2400.00 /mile 6-10 miles

\$ <u>2300.00</u>/mile 11-20 miles

\$ 2300. 60/mile 21 miles and over

```
Solid Yellow, Class 2T, Type A Traffic Stripe - in place
            701A-034
5.
                           \frac{2500.00}{\text{mile}} miles
                           2400.00/mile 6-10 miles
                           300.00/mile 11-20 miles
                          2300. mile 21 miles and over
                             Broken Yellow, Class 2T, Type A Traffic Stripe- in place
6.
            701A-044
                           1250, mile 0-5 miles
                         1200, 67 mile 6-10 miles
                           1150.0°/mile 11-20 miles
                            1 50.00/mile 21 miles and over
                             Solid White, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe - in place
7.
            701A-231
                       \frac{3200}{\text{mile}} mile o-5 miles
                       $ 3000.00/mile 6-10 miles
                           <u>Alolo.</u> mile 21 miles and over
                             Solid Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe - in place
8.
           701A-235
                       $ 3200. mile 0-5 miles
                       $ 3000. mile 6-10 miles
                           2800. mile 11-20 miles
                           2600. mile 21 miles and over
                             Broken Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe - in place
           701A-245
9.
                       $ 2000, mile 0-5 miles
                       $ \700. mile 11-20 miles
                            1600, or/mile 21 miles and over
```

Traffic Control Markings, Class 2T, Type A – in place

\$\sum_{\circ}\circ}/\square foot

Traffic Control Legends, Class 2T, Type A – in place \$______/square foot

BID NO: 2022-7

BID NO: 2022-7								
BID ITEM: Hot Mix Asphalt (
BID OPENING: Thursday, Septer) a.m.		4.	4.	4			
				,		424B	424A	424A
	BID	NO	LOW	NO	BID	լ ա		
	BOND	BID	BID	RESP	AMOUNT			
Midsouth Paving, Inc.						52.	6	63.50
23010 Hwy 72			V			2.	63.50	3,
Tuscumbia, AL 35674	X					8	50	ŏ'
							1	
Rogers Group Inc.						58.	65.00	65.00
520 Three Mile Lane	V					150) (
Tuscumbia, AL 35674	X					00	0	8
	-							
			1]
·	ļ 					1	 	
							·	
	-		_			 		
			ļ					
			İ					
						1		
		<u> </u>	<u> </u>			<u> </u>		
			1]
	 					<u> </u>		\vdash
	1		}					
				1				ļ
	 		ļ <u>.</u>			-		
					Í			
			}	1	Į.]]
	1	I	l		L		<u> </u>	

MidSouth

BID FORM

BID INVITATION NO. <u>2022-7</u> Effective <u>October 1, 2021</u> thru <u>September 30, 2022</u>

HOT MIX ASPHALT (PICK-UP AT PLANT)

ITEM

Item 1. 424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, ½" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement waived local approved limestone may be used)(25% RAP Maximum)

Item 2. 424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, ½" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (25% RAP Maximum)

item 3. 424B, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer,
1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement waived – local
approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP)

3.50\$ 1 per ton

63.50 \$ per ton

\$ 57 % per to

<u> Andrica de la companya de la companya de la companya de la companya de la companya de la companya de la compa</u>

Effective October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022 BID INVITATION NO. 2022-7

HOT MIX ASPHALT (PICK-UP AT PLANT)

ITEM

Item 1. 424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, ½" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

local approved limestone may be used)(25% RAP Maximum) Range A/B (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement waived -

Item 2. 424A, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Range A/B (25% RAP Maximum) Layer, 光" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Item 3. 424B, Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, approved limestone may be used) (25% RAP) (With Siliceous Aggregate Requirement waived – local 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B -

> \$ 65.00 /per ton PICKED UP @ PLANT

Rogers Group. Inc. 9-23-2021